
$2,350 - 716 - 2033 Kennedy Road, Toronto (agincourt
South-Malvern West)
MLS® #E12445569 

$2,350
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family

Agincourt South-Malvern West, Toronto
(agincourt South-Malvern West), Ontario

This brand-new, modern K Square Condo
offers a wealth of luxury amenities and comes
fully furnished. Conveniently located near
Highways 404 & 401, and just steps away from
TTC, shopping centers, and restaurants, this
sun-filled 1+1 unit features an open-concept
layout, 2 full bathrooms, and a spacious den
that can be used as a second bedroom.The
unit boasts built-in appliances, an open
balcony perfect for enjoying fresh air and
beautiful views, and floor-to-ceiling windows
that flood the space with natural light. You'll
also enjoy a scenic view of the garden from
both the living room and bedroom. This condo
comes with the added convenience of parking
and a locker.The building boasts top-tier
amenities, including a kids' zone, serene Chill
Out Lounge, private music rehearsal rooms, a
cozy guest suite, an expansive library, and
much more. Dont miss out on this immaculate,
never-lived-in homeschedule a visit today! No
smoking allowed. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # E12445569

Price $2,350

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00



Type Single Family

Sub-Type Condominium/Strata

Community Information

Address 716 - 2033 Kennedy Road

Subdivision Agincourt South-Malvern West

City Toronto (agincourt South-Malvern West)

Province Ontario

Postal Code M1T0B9

Amenities

Features Balcony

Parking Spaces 1

Parking No Garage, Underground

Interior

Appliances Cooktop, Dishwasher, Dryer, Microwave, Oven, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office BAY STREET GROUP INC.
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