
$399,000 - 62 Beckwith Street E, Perth
MLS® #X11913787 

$399,000
0 Bedroom, 0.00 Bathroom, 38,018 sqft
Retail on 0.00 Acres

907 - Perth, Perth, Ontario

Unique property, Perth jail is located in the
centre of picturesque and historic Perth
Ontario. Property has numerous possibilities
for redevelopment. Institutional &
Multi-residential. Property was built with
massive limestone cut stone, including the wall
that surrounds the property. Heritage
designation will require close attention to
details to meet heritage restoration guidelines
from the town of Perth. The ideal builder will
welcome the challenge to recreate a piece of
Canadian history in one of the most beautiful
town in Eastern Ontario. Perth is located on
the Tay River and one hour drive from Ottawa.
**EXTRAS** Everyone entering the structure
will do so at their own risk. The property is
being sold "as is" and no warranty whatsoever.
The area shown is from Geo Warehouse and
not verified. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # X11913787

Price $399,000

Bathrooms 0.00

Square Footage 38,018

Acres 0.00

Type Retail

Community Information

Address 62 Beckwith Street E

Subdivision 907 - Perth



City Perth

Province Ontario

Postal Code K7H2H9

Amenities

Features Irregular lot size

Parking Spaces 5

Exterior

Lot Description 157.54 x 210.38 FT ; yes

Listing Details

Listing Office COLDWELL BANKER SARAZEN REALTY
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