
$619,000 - 9 Underside Lane, Frontenac (frontenac
South)
MLS® #X12106137 

$619,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

47 - Frontenac South, Frontenac (frontenac
South), Ontario

A one owner waterfront home built by current
owner to maximize glorious water views of
Thirty Island Lake. This turn key cottage/home
comes complete with everything you need to
enjoy the fun and sun this Summer. Situated
on ten treed acres on a private country road
just off Westport Road, strategically placed at
the southern end of this deep water lake that
features no public access.  Skiing, swimming
and floating are highly recommended, along
with walking in the woods on your ten acre lot.
Many of the interior furnishings were hand
made in the basement from pine trees on the
property including a wonderful family sized
pine table with benches on each side. And the
tools that made the furniture as well as extra
materials are included. A high dry basement
with walk out could easily provide double the
living space for those with ambition. Your
family will love the14x16 screened in sun
porch with great water views for those summer
evening dinners. Built with2x6 fully insulated
walls and 2 wood stoves, a well and septic
allows you year round access and the road is
maintained year round too. Easy access to the
waterfront, the home features three bedrooms
a large open concept living area open to the
kitchen with numerous windows overlooking
the lake. A large deck wraps around two sides
to complement the screened in porch and
there are fire pits, horseshoe pits and plenty of



space to entertain the children. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # X12106137

Price $619,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Half Baths 1

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Bungalow

Community Information

Address 9 Underside Lane

Subdivision 47 - Frontenac South

City Frontenac (frontenac South)

Province Ontario

Postal Code K0H1T0

Amenities

Amenities Beach, Fireplace(s)

Utilities Electricity

Features Cul-de-sac, Wooded area, Irregular lot size, Carpet Free

Parking Spaces 5

Parking No Garage

View Lake view, View of water, Unobstructed Water View

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Waterfront

Interior

Appliances Oven - Built-In, Range

Heating Wood Other

Cooling Wall unit

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

# of Stories 1



Basement Walk out

Exterior

Exterior Aluminum siding, Vinyl siding

Lot Description 317 x 2000 FT|10 - 24.99 acres

Foundation Block

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX FINEST REALTY INC., BROKERAGE
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