
$2,150,000 - 1159 Schufelt Road, Lake Of Bays (mclean)
MLS® #X12444437 

$2,150,000
3 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family on 0.00 Acres

Mclean, Lake Of Bays (mclean), Ontario

Welcome to "Birchbent" on beautiful Lake of
Bays. Experience this unique property that
boasts a spectacular view and a main cottage
that exudes warmth and charm. From the
moment you arrive, you will be enraptured by
the stunning panoramic lake views that make
this property magical. This traditional Muskoka
cottage has been well maintained and lovingly
cared for over the years. Entering into the
Muskoka Room, you will be greeted by the
comfortable living area that offers stellar views
over the lake. The Dining and Living Room are
anchored by a magnificent granite stone
fireplace. Down the hallway you will find 2
spacious bedrooms and a 4 - piece bathroom.
The Kitchen is very functional and perfect for
preparing meals. Running across the front of
the Muskoka Room is a large, comfortable
screened Veranda which looks out to the lake
and waterfront below. Under the Veranda
there is a storeroom and a private office
space. Connected to the main cottage via a
breezeway is a large cabin that has been
renovated and offers a spacious bedroom and
living area. There is a large deck at the front of
the cottage that serves as a great area for
entertaining. Here, you can also enjoy
dreamlike nights with soft mood lighting and
music. Follow the steps down to the waterfront
where you will find a large dock embraced by a
natural granite shoreline and deep water.
Discover another waterfront feature by
following a pathway to your own private
beachfront that offers shallow water which is



excellent for swimming. There is a firepit set
back from the beach where you can enjoy a
fire at night. The property offers ample space
for future expansion possibilities. Located at
the southwest end of Lake of Bays, "Birchbent"
is only a little over two hours from Toronto and
is 20 minutes away from the towns of
Bracebridge and Huntsville. Properties like this
rarely come to market, and it is being offered
for the first time in 75 years. This is the
opportunity that you have been dreaming of. **
This is a linked property.** (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # X12444437

Price $2,150,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 1.00

Acres 0.00

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Bungalow

Community Information

Address 1159 Schufelt Road

Subdivision Mclean

City Lake Of Bays (mclean)

Province Ontario

Postal Code P0B1A0

Amenities

Amenities Beach, Fireplace(s)

Utilities Electricity, Wireless, Electricity Connected, Telephone

Features Hillside, Wooded area, Rocky, Sloping, Partially cleared, Waterway

Parking Spaces 7

Parking No Garage

View View, Lake view, View of water, Direct Water View, Unobstructed Water
View

Is Waterfront Yes



Waterfront Waterfront

Interior

Appliances Water Heater

Heating Electric Baseboard heaters

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Wood

Lot Description 48.8 x 84.4 M|1/2 - 1.99 acres

Foundation Wood/Piers, Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Professionals North
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