
$2,350 - 137 - 290 Zenith Private, Ottawa
MLS® #X12459105 

$2,350
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family

7711 - Barrhaven - Half Moon Bay, Ottawa,
Ontario

Welcome to 290 Zenith Private - Available
November 1, 2025! Bright and modern
2-bedroom, 1.5-bath upper unit located in the
growing Half Moon Bay community. Main level
features an open-concept living space with
stainless steel appliances, breakfast bar,
plenty of storage, a half bath, and a private
balcony. Upstairs, you'll find two spacious
bedrooms, one with a walk-in closet and
private balcony, and the other with a
walk-through closet and cheater ensuite.
Convenient in-unit laundry on the upper floor.
2 parking spots included (no additional parking
available). Tenant pays all utilities. Available
November 1, 2025. Photos from before
tenancy or of an identical unit. Perfect for
professionals or couples looking for modern
comfort in a convenient location! (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # X12459105

Price $2,350

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Half Baths 1

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Condominium/Strata

Community Information

Address 137 - 290 Zenith Private



Subdivision 7711 - Barrhaven - Half Moon Bay

City Ottawa

Province Ontario

Postal Code K2J6N2

Amenities

Features Balcony, In suite Laundry

Parking Spaces 2

Parking No Garage

Interior

Appliances Water Heater - Tankless, Blinds, Dishwasher, Dryer, Microwave, Stove,
Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Vinyl siding

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX HALLMARK REALTY GROUP
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